
 

Blackmagic H.264 Prorecorder (250 EUR)

Luogo Piemonte, Torino
https://www.annuncici.it/x-78298-z

Capture from broadcast decks to SD and HD H.264 files! Now it's easy to distribute your client's H.264
video files to websites, YouTube™, iPhone™ and even iPad™ Blackmagic Design's H.264 Pro Recorder
handles capture from all popular video formats so you can encode directly from professional broadcast
decks! Only $495 Professional Encoding H.264 Pro Recorder is for the industry professional who needs
professional encoding from SDI, HDMI, analog component/composite and balanced audio! H.264 Pro
Recorder includes Blackmagic Design's powerful Media Express for frame accurate deck control with
EDL import! Media Express lets you encode on Mac and Windows! Highest Quality Video Capture H.264
Pro Recorder allows you to select between SDI, HDMI and analog component video inputs. You can
select to take audio from the SDI, HDMI or stereo balanced analog audio input jacks. H.264 can be
connected directly to HD or SD video sources because the SDI, HDMI and analog component inputs all
switch between formats. This means you can capture from HDCAM, Digital Betacam, Betacam SP, DVD
players and more! Maximum Flexibility! The perfect low cost way to capture from professional broadcast
decks directly to SD and HD H.264 files! With new ways of delivering content to consumers, now it's easy
to capture old or new programming content into the same file format used on the web, iPad™, iPod™,
iPhone™, Apple TV™, YouTube™ and more! Capture directly from SDI, HDMI and component analog video
with embedded SDI, HDMI and balanced analog audio inputs. RS-422 deck control is included with
software for Mac and Windows! Preserve Archive Footage Old videotapes are delicate and have a limited
life. With old videotapes deteriorating and decks that can play them getting rare, encoding video is the
only way to preserve valuable footage! Use H.264 to archive old programming, news footage and other
materials that might be on old videotape forma

 Marca ?Blackmagic Design
 Produttore ?Blackmagic Design
 Modello ?VIDPROREC
 Nome modello ?H264 Pro Recorder
 Dimensioni prodotto ?13.4 x 6.8 x 14.9 cm; 498.95 grammi
 Numero modello articolo ?VIDPROREC
 Anno modello ?2014
 Numero articolo ?VIDPROREC
 Interfaccia Hardware ?USB
 Schermo a colori ?No
 Le pile/batterie sono incluse? ?No
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 Pile/batterie richieste ?No
 Totale porte USB ?1
 Tipo di connettori ?HDMI
 Ha l'autofocus ?No
 Pila/batteria ricaricabile inclusa ?No
 Controllo a distanza incluso ?No
 Ha tasti programmabili ?No
 Peso articolo ?499 g

 Perfettamente funzionante

 Tel: 3925828900
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